

1. Within your trust how many patients have been treated with the following products in the past 3 months you have available;

MabThera IV (rituximab)  
 MabThera SC (rituximab)  
 Truxima (rituximab)  
 Gazyvaro (obinutuzumab)  
 Imbruvica (ibrutinib)  
 Zydelig (idelalisib)  
 Arzerra (ofatumumab)

The Royal Surrey County Hospital NHS Foundation Trust Pharmacy Department does not record the information in a format that can extract a response in relation to RSCH patients only. The cost of compliance to gather, analyse and report on the requested information would exceed the appropriate limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act.

2. Please can you state the number of patients for the above drugs for the following indications;

Follicular lymphoma [C82.0 to C82.9]  
 Diffuse Large B-cell Lymphoma [C83.3]  
 Chronic Lymphocytic Leukaemia [C91.1]  
 All other B-cell, haematological malignancies (all C82, C83, C85, C88.0, C88.4 codes not listed above)  
 Rheumatoid Arthritis [M5 and M6]

In the table below find the total number of patients under the care of Rheumatology and Oncology who have been treated with each of the drugs listed between in the last 3 months (February-April 2017) for any indication. The total number of patients treated with the agents is listed as we do not record the indication for treatment on the pharmacy dispensing system. The data may therefore include patients who have been treated with these drug for indications other than those stated in the request. Where a drug/pack size is not listed it is because we have not supplied it within the specified time frame.

	Total number of patients treated irrespective of indication		
	2017		
	Feb	Mar	Apr
<b>Rheumatology cost centre</b>			
RITUXIMAB (MABTHERA) 100 mg in 10ml Intravenous Injection		1	
RITUXIMAB (MABTHERA) 500 mg in 50ml Solution for Infusion	6	4	3
<b>Haematology/Oncology cost centre</b>			
IBRUTINIB 140 mg Capsules	11	7	9
IDELALISIB 150 mg Tablets	1	1	1
RITUXIMAB (MABTHERA) 100 mg in 10ml Intravenous Injection	30	38	13
RITUXIMAB (MABTHERA) 1400 mg in 11.7ml Subcutaneous Injection	9	4	10
RITUXIMAB (MABTHERA) 500 mg in 50ml Solution for Infusion	33	33	15

3. **Does your trust code haematological malignancies against ICD10 codes?** Yes the Trust does code haematological malignancies.